From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 14, 2014 9:04 PM
To: lawrence delson; Eileen Alexanderson
Subject: Re:

why ? and when is someone supposed to tell me, =

On Tue= Oct 14, 2014 at 4:22 PM, lawrence delsnn_ wrote:

Jeffrey

Further to my conversation with =ileen, she will pay tomorrow, between 15 and 18 million of your fee, with =he
balance to follow next week. She advises the schedule is subject to Leo="s approval, tomorrow am.

Larry
Del=on International, Inc.
P.O. BOX 3=76

New York, NY 10163

)

=font color="#000000">(F) 646-810-0217 <tel:646-810-0217>

=C24) please note

The information containe= in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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