
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 7, 2014 10:24 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Karyna Shuliak_NY 

starting thurs negotaiate the best price. they are o=ly giving us 10 percent , should be 30 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 6:21 PM, Karyna Shul=ak 
wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 
=div> 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ana Carolina Gomes 
Date: October 7,=2014 at 6:02:47 PM EDT 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Eduardo 
Subject: Karyna Shul=ak_NY 

Karina,=how are you? 

I just spoke to =regory about the latest revisions for all units, and we still have quite a=lot of work to do 
in order to finalize the options. <=p> 

Also as I mentioned we are holding a large amount o= inventory. 

Please understand= as much as I would like to keep working and wait until you are ready, con=idering 
the scale of the project and the final total amount which will be =ver $200,000., we would need a $60,000. deposit for 
all the furnitur= we are holding and all possible changes until the final amount is defined= 

=span style="font-size:12.0ptcolor:#595959">l will wait for your comment=. 

Thank you. 
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Best regards,<=> 

=/u> 

Carolina Gomes 

<=pan style="font-size:13.5ptfont-family:"Courier New";color:gr=y" lang="IT">a r t e f act o 

17651 Biscayne Blvd. 

Aventura, Fl 33160<=> 

P=one: 

Fax: 

<=pan style="color:grarlang="IT =/b> 

www.artefact=.com <http://www.artefacto.=om/> 

</=iv> 

=C2 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only =or the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthoriz=d use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this 
communication and all copies =hereof, including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved </=iv> 
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