From: Eileen Alexanderson <

Sent: Tuesday, October 14, 2014 10:45 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: RE: Re:

GEES, this is a dangerous game of telephone-Rich calls Larry, Larry asks me...
Since | spoke to Larry much earlier, looks like Schwitters S due are $1mil less. We are increasing the bank line-looked like
it wouldn't be in place for several days but late this afternoon | got word Jane sent the docs to Leon, can use that for the

Schwitters if need be. KUE money should come in to BFP on the 16th.Things are tight but | think we will be ok to pay full
amt-just need to run by Leon in the morn.

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 14, 2014 5:04 PM

To: lawrence delson; Eileen Alexanderson
Subject: Re:

why ? and when is someone supposed to tell me,

On Tue, Oct 14, 2014 at 4:22 PM, lawrence delson <I_ -e:mailt_> wrote:

Jeffrey

Further to my conversation with Eileen, she will pay tomorrow, between 15 and 18 million of your fee, with the
balance to follow next week. She advises the schedule is subject to Leon's approval, tomorrow am.

Larry

Delson International, Inc.

P.O. BOX 3776

New York, NY 10163

(T) 646-801-7819 <tel:646-801-7819>

(F) 646-810-0217 <tel:646-810-0217>
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please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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