
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 10:53 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: CF 

I will now build cash projection model across entities with inputs for=variables 
Heather to provide update on art sale amount. 
Heritage payment is to be paid Monday. Paid thru 2013. 

On Oct 24, 2014, at 6:23 PM, "Eileen Alexanderson" wrote:=br> 

Complement to LB cash flow Rich gave you earlier-thi= shows the bigger picture. 

Trust cashflow in total is fine-will just potentiall= require some transfer between the trusts. 

Eileen Alexander=on 

Elysium Management<=:p> 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 

New York NY 10022 

Phone . 

Email: 
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