
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 15, 2014 2:29 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: MODEL FINANCIALS FOR 

it shows 360 in billing and less than 100 in payment= ( quick glance. ), agency 20 percent . taxes 35 . =on than. I cant 
reconcilebut might be missing something 

On Wed, Oct 15, 2014 at 10=26 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote:<=r> 

pleas= advise on what type of analysis you would like from attached numbers 
=hank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="mar in-top:0px;mar in-ri ht:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: Lesley =roff 

Subject: Fwd: MODEL FINANCIALS FOR ANNA IARY=YCH 

Date: October 15, 2014 at 10:18:04 AM EDT 

=o 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: =/span>Fwd: MODEL FINANC=ALS FOR 

Date: October 15, 2014 at 10:17:06 AM EDT 

EFTA_R1_01774999 
EFTA02592218



To: Lesley Groff 

Here's the statement 
Thank you 
ar>Sent from my i Phone 

Begin forwarded message: 

=blockquote type="cite">From: Nick Karathomas 
October 9, 2014 at 12:46:18 PM EDT 

To: 

Subject: MODEL FINANCIALS FOR 

This message contains 3 pages in PDF format.<=span> 

<1=iv> 

=C24> please note 

The information containe= in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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