
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 15, 2014 5:17 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: update on fees 

???? 

On Wednesday, October 15, 2014, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grnail.com> wrote:<=r> 

yes 

On Wed, Oct 15, 2014 at 10:=4 AM, Richard Kahn 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,&=39;cvml > wrote:> 

j=st spoke with larry delson and he told me that eileen was heading over to =eon office now 
to present him a snapshot of his cash balances and let him know that your f=e is due today 
larry believes that 15-18mm will be paid today 

sooner 
please advise if ok for me to call eileen for an update at 12pm if i do not=hear from larry or eileen 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

please note 

The=information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is inten=ed only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
U=authorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have receive= this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return=e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml','=jeevacation@gmail.com');> ,=and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all=attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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