From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, Movember 5, 2014 2:31 PM
To: ann rodriquez

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: LS) Heavy Equipment: Parts needed
Prices

On Wednesday, November 5, 2014, ann rodrigquez f._:s- wrote:

Hey Bos=man,
Just confirming the purchase of all the Heav= Equipment Parts requested as well as parts for the Polaris.

Please advise,
Ann R.

DISCLAIMER: The=information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and p=otected from disclosure, If
you are not the intended recipient, you are he=eby notified that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this
c=mmunication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communicatio= in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete al= copies.

please note

Th= information contained in this communication is confidential, may be at=orney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is inte=ded only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE =nauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any par= thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
receiv=d this communication in error, please notify us immediately by retur= e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and a=| copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights rese=ved
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