
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 12, 2014 4:44 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: September 

yes 

On Wed, Nov 12, 2014 at 12:31 PM, Richard Kahn < <mailto 
wrote: 

attached is allan and david hasson septem=er invoice in the amount of 19,950 

allan with david has=on (total of july / aug / sep 2014) = 47,200 
allan with marks =aneth (total of july / aug / sep 2013) = 85,105 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
to /a> 
fax  > 
cell <tel > 

Begin forwarded message: 

H=sson < 

as=well. 

> > 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: David 
<mailto 

Subject: September 

Attached is the September =illing, which includes mostly corporate work but some personal tax work 

I have included a detailed bill, and an additional one f=r Southern Trust. 
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=/u> 

Best, 

<=div> 

=br> 

please note 

The in=ormation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorn=y-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended=only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unawhorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part th=reof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received t=is 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-=ail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all c=pies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved=br> 
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