
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 4, 2014 10:13 PM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Subject: Re: Global Black Balance 2014 and FY 2015 

again„ please footnote the timber? 

On Tue, Nov 4, 2014 at 6:04 PM= Richard Joslin <mailto > wrote: 

Rich — 

Let's discuss expenses I may be missing. =AO Art consultant — placeholder only 

JEE-

I did not put the $2MM amount down due to privacy is=ues. 

I can add real estate tax — some of these it=ms are paid via the $15MM of "Household" 

=A0 

Richard Joslin 

CFO 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Ave 

Ste. 1401 

New York, NY 10022 

(w) (646) 589-0305 <tel:%28646%29%20589-0305> 

(c) (203) 581-0509 <tel:%28203%29%20581-0509> <=p> 

(f) (646) 589-0330 <tel:%28646%29%20589-0330> <=p> 
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please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=II rights reserved 
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