From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 6:37 PM
To: Daphne Wallace

Subject: Re: Restoration Hardware Quote

ok

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 2:29 PM, Daphne Wallace _cmailtc:_ > wrote:

Greetings Mr. Epstein,

Below is a quote for =he “Del Mar" daybed replacement drapes for the Palm Beach. €=A0

Th=s order will complete the refurbishing of the Restoration Hardware outdoor=furniture at Palm Beach. All of
the cushions were replaced in October.

Cost for =he 2 sets of drapes, including estimated tax and shipping - 5 2,079.70
Estimated=delivery to Palm Beach - 12/19/14
Is it okay to place this order?

Respectfully,
==iv class="gmail_quote">

Daphne
=div class="gmail_quote">

<http://www.restora=ionhardware.com>
Quote Notification
<http://=ww.restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank. gif>

Thank You

Quote #OH564085</=>
Thank you for requesting a g=ote from Restoration Hardware, Please save this email for your reference.,
<http://=ww.restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>

Quote Information
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Trade Client Contact
Daphne Wallace
SLK Design LLC Trade Id: 201309069502

Palm Beach, FL 33480
<mailto||| | T - Kashmir Singh

Restoration Hardware - CSC Trade

— -
tradecs@restorationhardware.com <mailto:tradecs@restorationhardware.com>

<http://=ww.restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>

Items in your Quote

= Price Quantity Total
<http://media.restorationhardware.com/is/image/rhis/pro=1671196?$GAL45&illum=0> Del Mar Queen Daybed
Drapes

Iltem #: 64250879 NATL</=d=>

Color: Matural

Delivery Method:

Standard Deli=ery Shipping <http://www.restorationhardware.com=customer-service/shipping-and-delivery-info.jsp>
IMPORTANT: CUSTOM ORDER TERMS OF SALE

Custom orders begin production immediately upon order and are built=to your specifications. They cannot be cancelled,
changed, returned or ref=nded at any time. A non-refundable 50% deposit will be taken when the orde= is placed.

5956.00 51,195.00 2 51,912.00
<http:=/www.restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>

<http://www.restorationhar=ware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>
Order Estimate

Retail Subtotal: $2,390.00

Trade Discount Amount: -5478.00
Trade Subtotal: 51,912.00
Shipping: S50.00

Estimated Sales Tax: 5117.72
Total {including estimated sal=s tax): $2,079.72
<http:=/www.restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>

<http://www.re=torationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif>

TERMS & CON=ITIONS OF THIS QUOTE:

This quote is not a contract for sale. All quoted prices are su=ject to change at anytime, with no prior notice, and pricing
is considered=established at the time the quote is converted into an order. This quote d=es not include applicable sales
tax, insurance, or similar charges. Shippi=g, handling, freight charges and rush delivery are estimates only. Sales t=x will
be calculated at the line item level upon each individual shipment =ased on the sales tax rates of the ship to location.
Prices are in United =tates Dollars (USDS). Products are not reserved until your quote is conver=ed into an order,
accepted and processed by Restoration Hardware.
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<http://media.restorationhardw=re.com/is/image/rhis/102413 email_orderConfirm?wid=700&fmt=jpeg&am=;qlt=90,0
Eop_sharpen=0&resMode=bicub&op_usm=0.0,0.0,0,=&iccEmbed=1=

Privacy Policy <http://www.restorationhardware.com/cus=omer-service/privacy-policy.jsp> | Frequently Asked
Q=estions (FAQs) <http://www.restorationhardware.com/customer-s=rvice/frequently-asked-questions.jsp> | Contact
Us=/a> | <http://www.restoratio=hardware.com/customer-service/contact-us.jsp> Customer Service
<http://www.restorationhardware.com/c=stomer-service/index.jsp>

please =ote

The information contained in this communication is
confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside informati=n, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If =ou have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com=> , and
destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -=Il rights reserved
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