From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 7:23 PM
To: Gregory Riches
Subject: Re: Handrail Estimate from Dualoy Leather

sample. stitiching. ? ideas. padding. et=

On M=n, Nov 24, 2014 at 2:46 PM, Gregory Riches -;"span:r wrote:

Jeffrey,

Attached is the invoice for the temporary leather st=ir rail.

They can match the leather on the RL bag but not exactl= on such short notice,
When we do the final one it can be an exa=t match.

Please let me know if you want to proceed with this?

-Gregory

Gregory Riches
IN=TERIORS

43 West 28th #3
NYC, NY 10001

Begin forwarde= message:

Sub=ect: Handrail Estimate from Dualoy Leather
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=C24 please note

The information contained in this communic=tion is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

constit=te inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addresse=. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies
thereof,

including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved
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