
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 18, 2014 5:50 AM 
To: Larry 
Subject: Re: Trip Cost Estimate (TN: 114095611) 

No 

On Monday, November 17, 2014, Larry <-> wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Takes approx 7 days=for landing permission for Marrakech,. Cost is $1330 for navigation fee,.<=div> 
Should I submit this request ? 

Attach is=trip cost estimate,. 

Sent fr=m my iPad 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Fred Quinonez <javascript:_e(=7B%7D;cvml 

Date: November 17, 2014 at 3:54:47 PM=EST 
To:' <javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml'=, "I=< 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml =;>> 
Cc: Sales Support <= 

<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvmr, );», TSSTCE=< 
<javascript:_e(%7B%7D,'cvml );» 

Subject:<=b> Tri Cost Estimate N: 114095611 
Reply-To: <javascript:_e(%7B%7D,Pc-vmr, 

> > 

Per your request. Please see attachment r=garding your trip cost estimate. Should you have any 
questions or concerns=regarding your trip, feel free to contact Tango Team.=/p> 

Fred Quinonez 

Lead Trip Cost Estimator 

EFTA_R1_01780679 
EFTA02595861



Foxtrot Team 

Sr. Trip Support Specialist=/span> 

Universal Weather and Aviation, Inc 

Success from the word GO=/u> 

=/blockquote> 

=C2, please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, andar>destroy this communication and all copies 

thereof, 
including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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