
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 12, 2014 10:04 PM 
To: ion nicola 
Subject: Re: 

no , you should do a sketch first, start=right away 

On Wed, Nov 12, 2014 at 4:43 PM, ion nicola < =/a» wrote: 

i got the picture. ok , we can do that.. do we =ave more pictures of that ? when do you want me to start? 

40=A0 thank you, 
40=A0 ion 

Date: Wed, 12 Nov 201= 12:45:47 -0400 
Subject: Re: 
From: 'eevacation@ mail.com <mailto "eevacation@gma=l.com> 
To: • /=> 

yes, send ion the same thing we sent liz h=bson photo of paris house 

On Wed, Nov 12, 201= at 11:03 AM, ion nicola < <mailto 
wrote:=br> 

hi jeffrey, 
i was just wonderin= if there is any project you would like me to do.. 

thank you= 
40=A0 ion 

=C24> please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

> > 
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JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is 
confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informati=n, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If =ou have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and 
destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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