From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, November 3, 2014 8:58 PM

To: Lvjet

Subject: Re: Zorro LV kitchen window Mold repair..
apporved

On Mon, Nov 3, 2014 at 4:55 PM, Lvjet &=t | G -/ :--n> wrote:

leffrey,

it appears my leak in kitchen window at Zorro house has been repa=red. Brice indicated heavy rain yesterday
and no leaks,.

only issue | have now is Mold that | would like to address asap. see a=tached photos of window and mold.

JJ quoted repair drywall and remove mold areas,. install new kitchen w=ndow since seals and condensation is
between window pane.
total cost including new window

$1,360.00 plus tax.
is this approve to proceed?

thank you
Larry

-----=riginal Message-----

From: Brice Gordon <

To: Larry Visoski < >

Ce: Zorro Ranch <[ -
Sent: Wed, Oct 29, 2014 2:36 pm

Subject: ZDC-LV Kitchen-MB

Larry

Attached is the quote to repair the water damage in your Kitchen and a=so the small remodel in your master
bedroom for Flat screen TV

Photo's of Water Damage for your reference

The Repair to the window sill in the Kitchen is broken down as follows=/div=

Option 1

repair water damage without new window $960.00
Option 2
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Repair water damage plus new window, add $400.00, total cost 51360.00 =lus Taxes

Master Bedroom work, remove old TV nook and frame out for flat screen,=including Electrical. $1,120.00, plus
Taxes

Flease review and let me know how you wish to proceed.
Any concerns please let me know

regards
Brice Gordon

Stanley, NM 87056

=lease note

The information contained in this communication is
c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside in=ormation, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee, It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawf=l. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and
destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved
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