
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 2, 2014 5:01 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Gregory and Russell 

talk about it when i see you 

On Tue, Dec 2, 2014 at 11:06 AM, Rich=rd Kahn 
wrote: 

is check still on=hold? 
if not should we prorate for 5 days Gregory will be away? <=div> 

should i wait to pay from JSC interiors which will=be open by tomorrow? 
(all previous months for gregory and russel= were paid via jee personal) 

also is russell fee =f 20% or 3,000 ok to pay as well if we prorate gregory should i =rorate this well too 

please advise 
than= you 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: Richard=Kahn 
<rich=rdkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com» 

Subject: Gregory 

November =6, 2014 at 2:15:41 PM EST 

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com&g=; 

regarding December fees i would like to remind =ou that Gregory will be away for 5 days in December 
Gregory asked if we=can have check for him next week 
should we send full 15,000 check or pr=rate? 
if prorate based on 31 calendar days or 22 weekdays? 

pleas= advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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EFTA02596576



5=5 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
f= 
ce 

</=iv> 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, andar>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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