
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 6:12 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Accounting Invoice - Oct 2014 

yes 

On Wed, Dec 10, 2014 at 1:35 PM, Richard Kahn < <mailto 
wrote: 

attached are accounting fees for october 2=14 

oct 2014 $14,125 
as co=pared to oct 2013 (with marks paneth) $39,900 

ple=se advise if ok to pay from STC 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel > 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

> > 

<=iv styleemargin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: David 
H=sson <David@shrc=as.com <mailto:David@shrcpas.com» 

Subject: Revised Bills 

Date:=December 9, 201= at 1:50:08 PM EST 

To: 'Richard Kahn' < <mailto > > 
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Hi Rich, 

4,=A0 please note 

The information contained in this=communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the=addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or=copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including=all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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