
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 24, 2014 11:26 AM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Subject: Fwd: 

forget the ben goertzl idea . i have other pla=s 

 Forwarded  - 
From: Richard Joslin ><=span> 
Date: Wed, Dec 24, 2014 at 6:55 AM 
Subject: Re: 
To: "j=ffrey E." <jeevacation@gm=il.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Regan arts numbers are net for the year and based on current scenario.=C2 Vs worst case 

On Dec 24, 2014, at 5:12 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com» wrote= 

charities shoudl show paid in 14 , poetry ipi, =AO. cash sections should invlud funds redeemable. in timing. =C2 
publishing seems incorrect for total as of dec 31.? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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