
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, December 1, 2014 10:01 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Invoice - 50 palms 

if they are smaller yes less. 

On Mon, Dec 1, 2014 at 4:58 PM, Ric=ard Kahn < 
wrote: 

please confirm Pat 3-8' range is ok? if not must they all be 8' 
in additio= if some are that small shouldn't they be cheaper than the $150 ne=otiated for 8' palms please advise thank 
you</=iv> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv st le="mar in-to :0 x•mar in-ri ht:0 x•mar in-bottom:0px;margin-left=px">=b>From: Daphne =allace 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice - 50 palms 

Date: December 1, 2014 at 2:22:52 PM EST 

To: Rich Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com&g=;, ann rodriquez 

<niafit

Gladiators, 

Attached for review is the invoice for =he 50 PR Palms: 

20. 15 ft ct @ $225 each =C2 = $4,500 (originally $275 each) 
30 - 3-8 ft. ct @ $150 ea=h = $4,500 (originally $175 each) 
1 phyto certificate =C2 = $ =A0 50 
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=A0 =C2 $9.050 

O=ce Chris confirms that he has in fact tagged 20 of 15ft ct. and 30 of smal=er stature - we are good to go with 
the wire. 

Ple=se advise, DW 

 Forwa=ded message 
From: Moraima Quin=ana 
Date: Mon, Dec 1, 2014 a= 2:16 PM 
Subject: Invoice • 50 palms 
To: Daphne Wallace < 
Cc: Ingrid Rivas 

Thanks! 

<=div> 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communication =s 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute in=ide information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It =s the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thi= 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be=unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com> , and 
des=roy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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