
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 19, 2014 1:22 PM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Subject: Re: art sales 

Pay expenses 

On Friday, December 19, 2014, Richard Joslin <-> wrote: 

Cash has been rec'd and proceeds are in Narr=ws LLC. Query if this money can be distributed to LDB 
(member/owner)=or whether it should be retained to pay expenses, eg Diana/Heather/ art lo=n legal/ etc. 

=A0 

Richard Joslin 

CFO 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Ave 

Ste. 1401 

New York, NY 10022 

(w) 

(c) 

(f) 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
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received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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