From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, December 26, 2014 10:33 PM
To: Gregory Riches

Subject: Re: Delivery NY - confirmation ASAP
ok

On Fri, Dec 26, 2014 at 5:31 PM, Gregory Riches [ NG - - ot e:

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded messag=:

from: "Carolina =omes" | NN - -

Date: December 26, 2014 at 1:48:35 PM E=T

To: "'Gregory Riches" [ NS -

b> ""Rosana™ ==, ""A_EDUAR=0
TREVISAN" i =, ""MARILIA OLIVE'&qu=t;

Subject: RE: Delivery NY - confirm=tion ASAP

Hello Gregory,
| h=pe you had a happy holiday.

Good to hear from you. The pick up happened =n the 24th and we're still set for the deliveries on th=
Sth, 6th and 7th.</=>

Best regards,
Caroli=a Gomes
artefacto

www.artefacto.com <http://www.artefa=to.com/>
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</=pan>

From: Gregory Riche= [mailto [ |  llGEG - |
Sent: Friday, December 26, 2014 12:28 PM

To= Carolina Gomes

Cc: Rosana; A_EDUARDO TREVISAN; MARILIA OLIV=

Subject: Re: Delivery NY - confirmation ASAP

Carolina

As far as | know all of this looks fine to me, Did the pick up sti=l happen and we set for the deliveries on

the 5th 6th and 7th in NYC?</=>

wrote:

Please confirm.

Thanks

<= class="MsoNormal">Gregory
Sent from my iPhone

<=div=

On Dec 23, 2014, at 6:41 PM, Carolina =omes [ NG - -

Hi Gregory, how are you?

I'm sending you this =mail to follow up on Rosana’s last email yesterday regarding the d=livery

to New York tomorrow morning December 24th . <=u>

Confianc= Moving Quote for the first part of the delivery is attached below, as persthe

conversation with Eduardo last week.

Please confirm asap, since the=truck is leaving tomorrow morning, 24th.</=>

et =
Please see the new quote for the service of attached orders;

The transportation will =e done at once.
Total=Volume/Itens: 71m3 / 77 itens.
Transport Miami — NY US5,750.00 (Aprox 5-7 business days)=/spanz=

Delivery:
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*Deliver= dos not included: Services that require the use of special equipment or o=tsourced
services, such as: hoisting; dismantling of embedded furniture, r=moval or instalation of funiture attached to the wall or
ceilling, chandel=ers, ceiling fans, disconnecting and reconnecting electronic devices, wash=ng machines, dryers, TV
antennas, satellite antennas, air conditioners, as=embling of furniture that requires specialized services)=u>

*10-11&am=:2G -10F * 067503/55 — 2 Itens €=93 6m3: U5390.00 (Insurance cost U$92.62 -
coverage US4,630.85)<=u>

* ='C2'll {j":}

*  =C2* 3M - PE =804 R0O4 — 065252/55 =93 5 itens — 9 m3 — US585.00 (Insurance cost
U5373.67 - co=erage U518,683.49)

=C2@

* =u>10B-10N-11B — 065179/55 — 15 itens — 24 m3: 1560.00 (Insurance US8=6.75 coverage
Us43,837.50)

-=C24p  *2Itens =E2** 6 m3: US390.00 (Insurance cost US771.83 - coverage US2,530.=4)
*¥=B7 *=AD <=>

* *=AD 2G-10F PE RD4 *=93 065166/55 - 18 ltens — 15 m3: U51170.00 (I=surance cost
LS580.98 — coverage US29,548.62)=/p>

* *=A0

¥ 10B-10M-11B = 066535/5= = 12 itens — 6 m3 : U=390.00 (Insurance cost U5225.29 -
coverage U511,414.40)

*o=02% <=>

* *=AD 2G-10F PE * =65267/55— 2 Itens — 2 M3: US130.00 (=nsurance cost US$93.70 -
coverage U5S4,684.80)

* .

* 10B-10N-11B - 066580/ 55</=pan>-3itens - 9 m3: US585.00 { Insurance cost L5138=93 -
coverage U56,946.27)

carol @artefacto.com <mailto:carol @artefacto.com> </=>

www.artefacto.com <http://www.artefacto.com/>

<f=iv>

<065131_8A-11P_PE_R04.pdf>
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<066579_8A-11P_PE_replacement from 065803, pdf=
<065166_2G-10F_PE_R04.pdf></=pan>
<065267_2G-10F_PE.pdf></==>

<067503_2G-10F_PE. pdf=
<065179_10B-10N-11B_PE_RD4.pdf>

=div=

<066535 10B-10M-11B_ chic chair_PE_replacement.pdf>
<066580_10B-10N-11B_PE.pdf><=>
=065252_3M_PE_R04.pdf><=span>
<067909_B8A-11P_replacement_Spectra.pdf></=>
<Delivery - Apts 11P-8A-2G-10F-11P-8A=3M-10B-10N-11B.pdf>

<f=iv>

=div class="gmail_signature">
©=A0 please note

The information contained in this commusication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addre=see. Itis the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copyi=g of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
a=d may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all a=tachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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