From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 5:53 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Zorra Mules and Can Am

2019's are available to be ordered and will arrive =-6 weeks later..
Richard Kahn
HBRE=Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa

cell S

On Aug 1, 2018, at 6:47 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

when do the 195 come

On Tue, =ul 31, 2018 at 10:02 PM, Richard Kahn _

<mailto N > wrote:

please advise if you want to =roceed with upgrading existing equipment with the following:
(3) 2018 Can-Am =utlander 570 Max XT (i assume color is intense red instead of =ilver)
https://can-am.brp.com/off-road/atv/outlander/outlander-570-max-xt. html

(1) 2018 Mule Pro FXT 4 x 4 (black) to replace existing 2012 =reen mule
https://www.kawasaki.com/products/2018-MULE-PRO-FXT

are colors correct?

are you ok with 2018 models instead of 2019 models?

trade numbers offered seem low. shall i push in pricing =nd trades or let leave as is..

please =dvise
thank you
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Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th =loor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

cell 917-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b>Brice Gordon <zde_rt41@gmail.com>
Subject: =/b>Fwd: R&S =owersports

Date: :,.I’b:-JuIyr 31, 2018 at 1:11:04 PM EDT

To: =/b>Rich Kahn <richardkahnl12@gmail.com>

Cc: =/b>Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com:

Rich
Attached

Photos of Bikes for =EE approval, these are on the show room Floor
the Red One is For =EE, the Silver for Guests

Revised proposals for =he purchase of JEE Bikes and a Mule
This the lowest they =ill go

This includes the trade of mule and 2 =ikes
how do you wish to proceed?

regards Brice

---------- Forwarded =essage ----------

From: <schavez7815@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, =ul 31, 2018 at 12:50 PM

Subject: Fwd: RE&S =owersports

To: zorro.office@gmail.com <mailto:zorro.office@gmail.com> , zdc.rtd1@gmail.com
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Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Galen Soden <sales.rsk@aol.com <mailto:sales.rsk@aol.com> >
Date: July 31, 2018 at 10:47:02 AM MDT

To: schavez7815@gmail.com <mailto:schavez7815@gmail.com>
Subject: R&S Powersports

Steve,
Please find attached the quotes for the Mule and =utlanders,

Galen Soden

R&S Kawasaki / KTM / BRP / Suzuki / Yamaha
505-292-6692

www.teamrands.com <http://www.teamrands.com/>

Brice Gordon

Stanley, NM

LSJ-GS), UsvI

Ph: (505) 934 =809

Begin =orwarded message:
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From: Brice Gordon <zdc.rt41@gmail.com>
Subject: ZM Ranch Mule and =ikes

Date: July 28, 2018 at 10:43:14 AM =DT
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Cc: Rich Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com>

Jeffrey

Attached Photo's of Existing Ranch 2007 Bikes =nd 2015 Mule

The 2015 Kawasaki Mule =as a continuing issue with its cooling system

It has been to two =ifferent Dealers over the past two years and the issue keeps =eoccurring.

This time the dealer is recommending pulling =he head on the engine at a estimate cost
between 51500.00 to 53000.00, =erbal.

Secondly

The Ranches 2007 ATV x 2 also need replacing, =ould you be open to handing down your Polaris

Bikes and Purchase New =ikes for you and your guests.

If so, would propose =e trade Existing mule and bikes for you and your guests, new mule for
=anch

Can we proceed as proposed?
regards
Brice Gordon

Stanley, NM

L5J-GSJ, UsVI

Ph: (505) 934 =809
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please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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