From: Bella Klein

Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 1:40 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Re:

Trying western union from online account first, if doesn't =ork i will reach out to Dasha.

Thank you,
Bella

On Jul 31, 2018, at 9:25 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

or ask dasha burak to send to her payapl and we =ill reimburse her

On Tue, Jul 31, 2018 at 9:17 AM, =ella Klein || R - t-:

Paypal is not working for =lisa, she contacted customer service but nothing changed. She has an =ccount
with Sberbank and would like to receive a wire transfer. Please =onfirm that | can proceed with wire.

Thank you,
Bella

On Jul 31, 2018, at 6:31 AM, jeffrey E. <jeavacation@gmail.com> wrote:

I e Ay number
_ alisa if =he needs help

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
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confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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