
From: brice gordon 
Sent: Monday, July 23, 2018 4:29 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Cc: Rich Kahn; LS1 GS1 
Subject: Re: LSJ Coral Stone 

wit= forward request to Luis 

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 9:29 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

wrote: 

need samples 

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 4:34 PM, =rice jgordo 

Good Morning 

Attached Estimates for Coral Stone from the DR 
Also E mail outlining Rebar an= Steel Cost from DR. 
The Ship is not licensed for US waters, but they would be prepared t= do so, if they went under a contract to 

supply for a year.!! 

Option 1. As requested 3000 Sqft, les= than container load, $7800 not bull nose or shipping 

Option 2. 5500 Sqft of tile, 400 pieces of bu=lnose tile, full container, $18,725.00, not including shipping 

how do wish to proceed 

=E200regards 

=div dir="ltr"> 
Bri=e Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
=SVI 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, =ay be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, an= is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property otlEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you ha=e received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br>return e-mail or by e-mail to 

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicat=on and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all ri=hts reserved 

Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 
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