
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2018 9:40 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Estimate 25722C from GEORGE BRITTAIN LAND DESIGNS, Inc. - $6,667.75 

pay 

On Wed, Jul 18, 2018 at 5:26 PM, Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Estimate 25722C from GEORGE BRITTAIN LAND DESIGNS, Inc. -=$6,667.75 

Date= July 18, 2018 at 12:10:33 PM EDT 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 

=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left=0px">Subject: Estimate 
25722C=from GEORGE BRITTAIN LAND DESIGNS, Inc. 

Date: July 18, 2018 at 12:06:45 PM EDT 

To: <bklein575@gmail.com=gt; 

Cc: &I 

Dear Bella, 

Please r=view the estimate below. Feel free to contact us if you have any question=. To schedule work as 
described in proposal, please forward a fifty percen= deposit to: 

P.O. Box 3479 
Palm Beach, FL 
33480 

We app=eciate the opportunity to provide you with a quote for your landscaping ne=ds. 

Sincerely, 

GEORGE BRITTAIN LAND DESIGNS, Inc. 
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</a chttp://www.avg=com/email-signature?utm_medium=email&utm_source=link&utm_campa=gn=sig-
email&utm_content=emailclient> Virus-free. www.avg.com 

<=div> 

q=lockquote> 

Q=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use =f the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclos=re or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication =n error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to =a href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" 

target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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