From: Jon Tomlinson

Sent: Monday, July 23, 2018 7:48 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: 2014 Income Tax Examination Changes

i'm going to be away from my computer for a little =it, but if you have any more questions, | can answer them in about
an =our.

On Jul 23, =018, at 3:38 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

payment by ?

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 9:17 PM, =on Tumlinsﬂn_ wrote:

Payments as an art =onsultant. This was all accounted for and shown as income to =ublime Art so not sure why
it's an issue, but I'm =athering that we're not going to disagree with any of the =indings.

On=Jul 23, 2018, at 3:12 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

remind me what the two 25k =tems she now included income was?  not =ift?

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 8:53 PM, Jon Tomlinson =span dir="Itr" class=""_

This just in from the auditor =E2 attached is the final determination.
They're looking for about 50k =dditional due.

We haven't =hecked their computations yet, but usually they're =ight.
We also need to amend her =Y/NYC tax return to reflect the IRS changes.

Basically there are two adjustments — 43,495 travel =djustment and 50,000 gross income adjustment,.
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please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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