
From: 
Sent: Saturday, July 28, 2018 1:40 PM 
To: Jeffrey E.; Josh Schmell 
Subject: Re: last year's 70th birthday present 

Jeffrey...that $30,000 will go to the apartment. That =s so appreciated. Josh will contact your office Monday. 
= = 

= = Had a terrific screening last night in East Hampt=n of Warner Bros. really odd film, "Crazy Rich Asians" we got all 
30 A=ians in East Hampton and 250 more stupid white people who thought this cul=ural cross over film would be funny 
to come. They all loved it. I think it=s one of the worst embarrassing concepts of showing rich Asians acting vul=ar. 
Whatever. 

We have a screening Sunday night in NYC and another in East Hamp=on next Sunday night of Spike Lee's 
"Blackkklansman" that is sensational.<=div> So we are busy this summer. 

Monday, Aug. 6th l=go to Patmos. Aug. 13-23 I am on Pepe Fanjul's boat in Spain with Juan Car=os. 

Jeffrey, for a gal living out of a suitcase since last June...l am =unctioning at full capacity....partially thanks to you and 
Josh and Brian.= xoxo P = = 
From: jePeggyffrey E. 
Sent: =aturday, July 28, 2018 3:25 AM 
To: peggy@peggysiegal.com<=div> 
Subject: Re: last year's 70th birthday present =/td> 

Hsppy to help mor= no worry 

On Sat, Jul 28, 2018 at 5:05 AM < > wrote: 

Last year you said you =ere giving me $100,000 for my 70th Birthday. 

I had one birthday dinner in June in London f=r 50 people at Harry's Bar that Jessica de Rothchild paid for. 

I hosted a second seated di=ner/birthday party in Southampton in July at Gigi and Avie Mortimer's hour= that 
cost $70,000 for over 100 people. This price included cater=ng, rentals, party designer, flowers, etc. I believe bills were 
submitted =o your office. 

=dam Lindemann hosted a lunch the following week, in Montauk at his Andy Wa=hol house for 50 people that 
he paid for. 

= = 

= = = 

The $30,000 that was l=ft over was to be used for renovating my apartment. My office asked for th=s last year 
and we never got it. That's as much as I know. 
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If the $70,000 is the gift, that is fine. Just =anted you to know the back story. I am always so appreciative of 
everythin= you do for me...and keep me afloat emotionally as well. I am your =ery loyal friend always. 

xoxo Peggy 
= = = 

From: jeffrey E. =8E 
Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 7:02 PM 
To: <=b>Joshua Schmell; Peggy Siegal 
Subject: 
=/tr> 

III check on last year, my rec=llection was that the second party didn't happen, but of course im=more than 
willingto help financially. Im back in two weers. 

=nbsp; please note 

The information contained in t=is communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, ma= 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of =he addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure=or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohib=ted 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in =rror, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.c=m, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
includ=ng all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

= please note 

The information contained in this c=mmunication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may =onstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or c=pying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited<=r>and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error= please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including =11 attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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