From: sel Kiein <

Sent: Friday, July 27, 2018 4:03 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Re:

should be $220 for ||| GG

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On Jul 27, 2018, at 11:59 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

whos dental charge just came through

please =ote

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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