From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 7:07 PM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: L5J_CC_OFFSHO_10,000.00_072518
yes

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 7:50 PM, Richard Kahn ||| G- - - - -

wrote:
please advise ok to have pontoons replaced=on nanna for total cost of 19,992
thank you
Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022
tel
fax
Begin forwarded message:
From: Ls) GsJ <[ -
<=>Subject: LS)_CC_OFFSHO_10,000.00_072518
Date:
To: Richard Kahn < <mailto > >, D=phne Wallace <
qmailm_: >, Brice L8] < <mailto > >
=br>

Good Afternoon Rich

Attached completed =redit Card Request Form for Offshore Marine. Could you please confirm
when=payment has been completed

Thank you

Warmest reg=rds
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