From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, August 11, 2018 2:37 PM
To: Peter Fenwick
Subject: Re: Final test for effect

reminder when i asked gino for his breakdown was when i fo=nd out 50% went for drinks and food

On sat, Aug 11, 2018 at 7:22 AM, Peter Fenwick=< (||| EGTcNcE

<mailto J N - > «rote:
=div class="m_3020901070085215386WordSection1">

Quite right, this experiment will show IF there are any truly f=scinating results at a distance, or as you say something
meaningful.

We are screening A=an so he is isolated, visually and auditory. We are looking at effects on =he Cardiac cycle and rate,
Skin response (autonomic System) Subjective sen=ations, present or absent and strength and character of light if seen.
=A0 We will thus have a good idea of the effect and how it effects the body=and its systems, IFitis present.

We are looking at the same time at ‘t=ained’ subjects, and ‘naive’ subjects, in a t=o0 x two paradigm.

If 20K is too much, would 10K be possible? Then we will have the answ=r, and then we can go for the full experiment if
you want. Analysis of dat= done by thoese who do NOT know the paradigm.

Peter

From: jeffrey =. [mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> |
Sent: 09 August 2018 19:53

Subject: Re: FW: inv=ice for project and set
=fu>

No . Sorry have yet t= see any indication of something meaningful

<=div>

On Thu, Aug 9, 2018 at 2:45 PM Peter Fenwick <[ G- - ot-:

Attached the invoice for the next experiment. We have eno=gh money for this but not for the next bit of getting
subjects to Rome etc=

Could we have another 20K, then by the end of September / October we wi=l have the answer to your question.
Can giving light DO anything?

=xperimental set up below!!
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=span style="color:#1f497d">
Would like to meet in Paris but am i= Scotland for the First week Sept.
Evolution has to be wider mind - =C2 changes shown by Spira are a good place to begin — | thin=!

Peter.

<mailto

From:<=pan lang="EN-U5"> Fabio Babiloni |mailm_

>

==>5ent: 30 July 2018 17:50

To: Giuseppe Bersani <N
Cc: Arianna -:an'anna.trettel@brainsiins.mm=fa:.-}; Peter Fenwick < -:mailtn_:u

<mailto = >
Subject: =nvoice for project

Dea= Giuseppe,

please find attached the invoice for the study to be performed.=u>

=u>

As agreed for=the financial issues related to Italian taxes, the invoice instead to be <=span=

20.000 =uros + VAT (22%) = 24,400 euro

it is for the moment of </=>

16.350 euros + VAT (22%) = =9.947 euros,

When other funds will be available (from taxes or from other source)=in the close future | will complete with
another invoice up to the final a=ount agreed among us for this specific phase.

We will have the situation of the p=rchasing material as in the following image for the study n.1 (e.g. only
b=havioral measurements). It includes Tablets, Shimmer, phidgets, trigger bo= etc etc.
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=u=
=/u>

I will start to make th= purchases ASAP since August is a typically “dead” moment =n Italy for the generalized
summer break of all companies, but the first d=ys of this week are still available for business.

=p class="MsoMNormal">

=p class="MsoNormal"=After this, we could start to d=scuss about the experimental setup as well as for the
statistic to be used=to understand the existence of an effect from AF to its students.

All the best fr=m the same city (for Giuseppe)

Fabio

FEEFEEBEEESEREELIEEEBE RS EETER IR FBEEREERE XX DD HE_EEREX R B ERREEREELRRER

<=pan lang="EN-U5"=Prof. Fabio Babiloni, PhD

Ass. Editor of IEEE Transaction on N=ural System & Rehabilitation Engineering
Ass, Editor of IEEE Transaction on B=omedical Engineering

Editor in Chief of International Journal of Bioelectromagne=ism

De=t. Molecular Medicine, University of Rome Sapienza

Scientific Director of BrainSi=ns srl, www.brainsigns.com <http://www.brainsigns.com/>

Tel: - |-
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<f=>

Da: Giuseppe Bersani <[ - - -

Invi=to: giovedi 26 luglio 2018 18:51

A: Fabio Babiloni <=a href="rnailtu:_' target=“_blank">_>

Oggetto: Fattura per progetto Peter
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Caro Fabio, <=span=

come ="accordo ti invio le informazioni per la fatturazione. =/u>

La fattu=a dovra essere intestata a: Associazione Mind-Education and Research =n Neuroscience and Medicine,
Via di =orre Argentina, 21. 00186 Roma
<https://maps.google.com/?g=\ia+d=+Torre+Argentina,+21.+00186+Roma&entry=gmail &source=g> . Pl 10582421003,
CF 97562290581 .=u>

Dovr=C3 essere comprensiva di IVA e l'importo complessivo (IVA compresa)= non dovrebbe superare i 19-
20.000 euro. Ho avuto un problema fiscale=rispetto alla quota di finanziamento nel 2017, che spero di recuperare
pre=to.

Saldero' immediatamente la fattura appena ricevuta. Puoi inviar=a al mio indirizzo e.mail universitario,

Ho informato il commercialista p=r il credito di imposta. Grazie.

Sentiamoci guando vuoi per qualunque dub=io.

A presto,

Giuseppe

z=div>

=C2 please note

The informa=ion contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-cl=ent privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only=for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthori=ed use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received thiscommunication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail =r by e-mail to
=eevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies=thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved</=>

plea=e note

The information contained in this communication is confi=ential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside inform=tion, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this commun=cation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. =f you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immed=ately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
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jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gms=il.com>, and destroy this csmmunication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyrigh= -all rights reserved
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