
From: brice gordon 
Sent: Monday, August 13, 2018 11:02 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: LS1 MC Kitchen Cabinets Refurbishment 

Ok 
Will work on that </=iv> 

Sent fr=m my iPhone 

On Aug 13, 2018, at 6:25 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
=br> 

No they inst=ll. - no way us. Kickboards etc 

On Mon, Au: 13, 2018 at 6:23 PM brice :ordon <=a 
href="mailto: 

Good evening 

wrote= 

Attached proposal: 
Refurbishment Kitchen Cabinets, for your rev=ew. 

<=iv class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small">Cost: $14926.00 
<=iv class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small">Lead time: 3 Weeks 
Install: By Client<=div> 
Hardware: Will u=e existing Pulls, new Hinges 
Price includes delivery to Tropical 

Kyle noted hardware cost was approx double the cost.<=div> 

Do you wish too proceed wit= ordering? 

Vdiv> 
regards 

Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 

Ph: 

&=bsp; please note 

1 

EFTA_R1_01793088 
EFTA02603709



The information contained in this comm=nication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addres=ee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying=of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and m=y be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com> , and 
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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