
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 3:53 PM 
To: Gretchen Buhlig 
Cc: Virginia DeSanto 
Subject: Re: ASU Origins to MIT Media Lab - Enhanced Education 

Thank you Gretchen. 

Ginny please advise when I can expect as i would like to finalize ASAP. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Jan 14, 2019, at 10:50 AM, Gretchen Buhlig > wrote:

Mr. Kahn, 

I have asked Ginny DeSanto, ASUF Treasurer, to send you the calculation for the Black family contribution to the 
Origins Project. 

Thanks, 
Gretchen 

Gretchen Buhlig 

CEO, ASU Foundation 
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From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 8:42 AM 
To: Gretchen Buhlig 
Subject: Re: ASU Origins to MIT Media Lab - Enhanced Education 
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can you please send the calculation this am.. 

thank you 

rich 

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 5:05 PM Gretchen Buhlig 
> wrote: 

Thank you for the Enhanced Education authorization. I will send the Black calculation on Monday. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 11, 2019, at 12:41 PM, Richard Kahn 
> wrote: 

attached is the signed authorization from Enhanced Education 

regarding Leon Black can you please provide calculation on the 467,150 amount to be 
transferred as Mr Epstein was under the impression from previous conversations that the amount was closer to 700,000 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn < 

Subject: MIT 

Date: January 11, 2019 at 2:28:53 PM EST 

To: Rich Kahn • ICE 
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Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

3 

EFTA_R1_01795220 

EFTA02604999


