From: brice gordon

Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 11:03 PM
To: Richard Kahn; Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Re: LSJ Cat equipment to buy

Goo= Evening Rich

=br>

please be =dvised JE would like to get Caterpillar Equipment ASAP and not continue to=Rent, therefore equipment
should be be sourced from Warren Cat.

regards Brice

On Tue, Aug 14, 2018 at 1:20 PM, bric= gordon _{mailtu_ wrote:

Rich,
Our Answers in Blue

If JE is ok with continuing =o rent until we obtain equipment , then we would recommend moving forward =ith
purchasing from Rimco,

Except for the Teleh=nlder, which we need ASAP

=span style="font-size:12.800000190734863px">Regarding the 303 & 307 =xcavators, the approach instead of
another Backhoe, one unit on G5J) =he other on LS), apart from Landscape work, they will be used primarily to=upkeep
roads on both Islands

Having 2 machines means =his work can be done simultaneously, and it cuts down on the moving back a=d forth
between islands

325 FL Ex=avator - Warren Cat has new machine arriving Sep 2=th in Texas vs Rimco =/b>sometime in December
2018

YES

307E2 - Rimco can have in 5 weeks vs Warr=n Cat which is currently available now in Texas..
303.57E2 - Rimco can h=ve in 3 weeks vs Warren Cat whi=h is currently available now in Texas..

Attached below are pictures of 2016 used 303.57E2 that Rimco has in st=ck with 999 hours No
=div style="font-size:12.800000190734863px">

TL 12550 Telehandler - Sep 28th in Texas vs Rimco sometime in December 201=

27202 Skid Steer - Warren Cat has new m=chine arriving Oct 23rd in Texa= vs Rimco sometime in Novembe=
2018
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Rimco will give & month warranty on =abor and materials (and | will try to negotiate more..) and we will just
=ve to pay for travel whereby all equipment bought from warren cat will onl= warranty equipment in state sold to..
A thought, Rimco are the =at dealer for the Caribbean, why are we not getting full warranty, especia=ly with this

size of order?
thank y=u

regards Brice

<=iv class="gmail_quote">0n Mon, Aug 13, 2018 at 3:37 PM, Richard Kahn _

=rice thank you for your feedback
| received additional updates today a=ong with photos you requested..

325 FL Excavator = Warren Cat has new machine arriving Sep 20th in Texas vs Rimco sometime i=
December 2018

307E2 Hydraulic Excavator and 303.=7E2 - do we need both?

307E2 - Rimco can have in = weeks vs Warren Cat which is currently available now in Texas..
303.57E2 - Rimco can have in 3 weeks vs Warren Cat which is=currently available now in Texas..
Attached below=are pictures of 2016 used 303,57E2 that Rimco has in stock with 999 hours<=div>

TL 12550 Telehandler - Warren Cat has new machine =rriving Sep 28th in Texas vs Rimco sometime in
December 2018

27202 Skid Steer - Warren Cat has new machine arriving Oct 23rd=in Texas vs Rimco sometime in
November 2018

Rimco=will give & month warranty on labor and materials (and | will try to negot=ate more..) and we will
just have to pay for travel whereby all equipment =ought from warren cat will only warranty equipment in state sold to..

Please advise which units to buy
Thank you</=iv>

=/div>
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Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington=Avenue, 4th Floor

New York, NY 10022
<https://maps.=oogle.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue, +4th+Floor+New+York,+NY+ 10022 Bentr==gmail &source=g>

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

=div style="color:rgb(0,0,0);font-family:Helvetica;font-size:24px;font-st=le:normal;font-variant-
caps:normal;font-weight:normal;letter-spacing:norma=;text-align:start;text-indent:0px;text-transform:none;white-
space:normal;w=rd-spacing:0px">cell

<=span:

<mailto

On Aug 13, 2018, at 11:23 AM, brice gordon || EEGTNEGEGE

wrote=

=div dir="Itr">
Goo= morning

<=div>

Attached for yo=r review

Alli=ems ticked move forward with pricing

Regarding 303 Mini EX, will review photo's =AOand hours

So=ry, the T1255D is a must have due toit's reach and load capacity
thank you

regards Brice

On Fri, Aug 10, =018 at 4:16 PM, Richard Kahn _

<maitto

then negotiate pricing

attached is summary of Rimco and Warren Cat equipment list
please r=view what each piece is equip with and finalize what we shall buy so then = can

prices below are all delivered to th= port of San Juan
attached are PDF's and links for all equip=ent on the list below

was thinking our barge ca= bring home a piece or two in September after muffler work
maybe=Bubbler can do a run as well??

3
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if not we can always use Tropical=/div>

please advise on final pieces to buy and attachme=ts
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington
<https://maps.google=com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+ 1002 2&entry=gma=|&source=g>
Avenue 4th Floor

New Yor=, NY
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New=York, +NY+10022&entry=gmail &source=g>
10022
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue=4th+Floor+MNew+York,+NY+10022 &entry=gmail&source=g>

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

ce!| I

Begin forwarded message:

p-]

Subject: RE: equipment to buy

Date: Augus=19, 2018 at 3:55:35 PM EDT

T=: "'Richard I{ahn"'_gt;

As per request, machines that are available can be ready for s=ipment in 4
weeks.

307 was sold this morning, we can order another with a=delivery time of 5
weeks

=span lang="EN-US" style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-
serif=color:rgb(31,73,125)">

MNew 272D have a delivery time of 12 weeks, we ha=e available used 236D from
our rental fleet but they are standard flow.=fu>

=fu=
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From: Richard Kahn [mailtcl:_

Sent: We=nesday, August 08, 2018 4:54 PM

Subject: R=: equipment to buy

thanks for sending

<=jy>

can you please send more de=ails such as photos and hours on used equipment
=/div>

we hope to buy every=hing on here and finalize sale this week

<=jy>

thanks=/div=

=2

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington
<https://maps=google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+4th+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entr==gmail &source=g=>
Avenue dth Floo=

<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+F=cor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail &source
=g> 10022
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexingto=+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022 &entry=gmail &source=g>
tel 212-971-1306
fax 212-320-0381
cell

On Aug 8, 2018, at 2:44 PM, Luis Marzan:_

=/span>

Product Support & Equipment 5al=s Representative, Caribbean Area| RIMCO,
Inc. | P.O. Box 36252%<=pan style="font-size:10pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-serif;color:rgh(102,5=,0)"> San Juan,
=A0Puerto Rico 00936

Office</=pan>: </=pan>=87-273-5722| Fax: 787-=83-8180| :,l"h::-cel:-

-,-":pan:r - =C2_~cmailt_ <=>| web: rimcocat.com
<image001.jpg&g=;
<image002.jpg=

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE: =C2 This e-mail and any other document attached
herein may contain propr=etary, confidential or privileged information that belongs to Rimco, Inc.=C2 Any

§
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dissemination, disclosure, distribution or copying of the conten=s of this communication is strictly forbidden without the
consent of the s=nder. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete or d=stroy this message and notify the sender
or the office of Rimeo, Inc., at =87-792-4300. Rimco, Inc. is not liable for any damages resulting fro= any modification or
falsification of an email that is originated by us.=C2 Moreover, although Rimco, Inc. has taken the necessary
p=ecautions to ensure that the data included herein is free of viruses or an= other malicious content, we cannot assure
that such is indeed the case an= disclaim any responsibility attributable thereto.

<image003.jpg></=pan>

<=spanz

From: =AORichard Kahn [=span lang="EN-US" style="font-size:11pt;font-
family:Calibri,sans-serif=color:rgb(149,79,114)">mailto | | A AEREEEE - '
]

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 9:50 AM

To: <mailto style=>

=div style="margin:0in Oin 0.0001pt;font-size:12pt;font-family: Times=New
Roman’,serif">Please call me to review attach=d list once you have some update on pricing and timing
Thank you=/div>

=tbody=>
Caterpillar
Attachments=/u>
323 Year 2015 5187,000Available
<f=d>H130 Hammer With hyd kit $92,000<=pan lang="EN-US"> Thumb 55,800 Mini Excavator
< f=jy>
307 E= Year 201= 5108,000 Available
Bucket, Thumb,Hamer,Blade
<f=iv=
303E CR2Year 2018 EEE,DDD:Span class="m_16402885162766256599m_1345866307788763203m_-
500781040876158=726apple-converted-space”> Available
307 Thumb 53,200</=>
307 Hammer 524,000
303 Used 2017 546,000 </=pan>Available

Telehander
TL1255D
<f=d>
New TL1055 $185,000
Skid Steer

=fdiv>
2720= XHP New =018 578,000

=u>0ther Brands

JLG 600 AN Narrow
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<=d style="padding:0in;height:23pt">
JLG 600A) $145,000
Flat Bed</=iv>

=ack GU713

<f=d>
Dump Truck =/span>

CAT 725 Off highway Truck Year 2011 5=50,000 Available
Freightliner M2106 </=iv>

=C2
=AD

Richard Kahn

HBRK Asso=iates Inc.

575 Lexington
<https://maps.google.com/?q=575+Lexington+A=enue+4dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail&source=g>
Avenue 4th Floor

<https://maps.google.com/?q==75+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022 &entry=gmail&sou=ce=g>
New York, NY

<https://maps.=oogle.com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York, +NY+10022 &entry=3Dgmail &source=g>

<=div>

<=r=

<=blockquote>

325FL Link

https://www.cat.com/en_US/products/new/equipment=excavators/medium-
excavators/1000025013.html| <https://www.cat.=om/en_US/products/new/equipment/excavators/medium-
excavators/1000025013.ht=l>

<=div>

323FL Link

https://www.cat.com/en_US/products/new/equipment/excavators/=edium-
excavators/1000032600.htm| <https://www.cat.com/en_U5/product=/new/equipment/excavators/medium-
excavators/1000032600.html>

Begin forwarded message:
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=/div>
Subject: 323 and 307 photos

Date: August 9, 2018 at 3:59:20 PM EDT

To: "~Richard ko [ - S

=div style="margin:0in Oin 0.0001pt;font-size:12pt font-family: Times=New
Roman’,serif">=Richard here the photos for t=e new 307 that was sold this morning, another one can be order and
deliver= time is 5 weeks, also photos for 323F, this one have as you can see on ho=r meter 1,074hrs.

<=div>

=/div=

<f=iy>

<=djy>

</=iv>
Luis Marzan =ADParts, Sale & Service Consultant | RIMCO, Inc. | P.O. Box
3625295an Juan,<=pan style="font-size:13pt"> Puerto Rico 00936

Office: 787-273-5722| Fax: =A0 787-783-8180 | ce!: | NI |
- *:=A0 Imarzan@rimco-inc.com {mailtu_ |=/b> web: rimcocat.com

<http://rimcocat.com/>

EFTA_R1_01785301
EFTA02605047



Warren Cat - Texas Bids

<f=iy>

Brice Gordon
LISV

Ph:
<L5) HD Equipment 1.pdf=<=div=>

Brice Gordon

UsvI

=div class="gmail_signature” data-smartmail="gmail_signature">
Brice Gordo=

The Saint James Group

UsSVi=/div>
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