
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 1:14 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Prosolar 

brian , you need to replace the system t=at was fully paid for. and then addtiional servies =and damages were 
incurred, . you can write us a check fo= 200k and be done . or you leave us no alternatice to pursue a claim=with 
actual and punitives, totally more than 700k. your choi=el 

On Thu, Jan 1=, 2019 at 8:09 AM Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

Richard Kahn 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=lockquote type="cite"> 
From: Brian Prosolar «= hr f=" 

Date: January 10, 2019 at 7:44:08 AM EST 
=b>To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re:=br> 

Morni=g. Perhaps when you're down here next week we could meet for a cup=of coffee and work out a 
solution? 

I was able to get a quote wit= a $40,000 reduction in cost from the manufacturer but am worried the 
erro=eous information you received is impacting your decision. 

=lease deduct the $40,000 directly from my previous offer. 
=br> 
Regards, 

Brian Walden 
ProSolar America, Ilc 
<=iv>Director of O .erat=ons 
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On Jan 9= 2019, at 5:08 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

=blockquote type="cite"> 
please provide update from=our last conversation on monday morning 
thank you 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc.<=span> 

=/blockquote> 

Prosolar Systems 

Let=tI39;s Get Social 
<https://www.facebook.com/ProSo=arSystems/> <https://twitter.com/pr=solaramerica?lang=en> 

<https://www.=nstagram.com/prosolarsystemsusvik 
<https://ci4.googleusercontent.com/proxy/0AVS=570jO6P2cJzXKI37P7WnU2SQp0lvdvRgoBrxwj-
sjQXMfMzzHCy2XRKfthyCG70z13mnVDWS0w=vaGLIGPSU7ZGxFSt87Y5vON6YPyUhGEVizMo4ZcUSmu30Q=s0-d-el-
fttfhttps://drive=google.com/uc?export=view&id=1SSwI0FrGSSxH0x60Ko3k6omEvUhg8GHF> </=> 
<https://plus.google.com/106485380732364759774> 

<=r>--

=AO please note 

The information=contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized =se, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or b= e-mail to 
jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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