From: Richard Kahn —

Sent: Wednesday, January 2, 2019 11:13 PM
To: Brice Gordon; Kyle reavis

Cc: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: Pops Garden

can =ou please respond timely to my emails thank =ou

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b>Re: Pops =arden

Date: =/b>December 27, 2018 at 5:53:09 PM =5T

To: =/b>brice gordon < N
Cc: J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> =, _

Brice is there a budget for the =hade house? If so please advise who approved. Thank you.

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

EFTA_R1_01796512
EFTA02605821



On =ec 27, 2018, at 12:50 PM, brice gordon wrote:

Afternoon

Firstly material =ot accidentally staged in the wrong place, it has been relocated to the =orrect location

| asked Brian to stake out foot =rint and | was going to forward photos of this and design to you today,
=ill forward tonight

The design match’s=that of the pervious shade house , except it will be on a concrete =ad

Basically today turned to hell and | was =nable to follow thru with this, apologizes

Brian and Donald can perform this work if

that's ok by you ?

Brice

Sent =rom my iPhone

On Dec =7, 2018, at 4:36 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= > wrote:

why are they builidng this in the =ursery. 2111 what is going on?

On =hu, Dec 27, 2018 at 3:05 PM Cashkim Bussue _ wrote:

Sent from my iPhone

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
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including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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