From: valeria chomsiy [

Sent: Wednesday, August 22, 2018 9:26 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Cc: Moam Chamsky

Subject: Fwd: Phone call

It went well,

He mentioned that he had =eceived an e-mail from Lesley saying that Deborah has the documents. Rich =oesn't.

| told him that Rich is having the same trouble than we are to =ave access to the documents and just getting partial
information sometimes=only by phone.

He said he would contact Debor=h to obtain the documents. We'll see.

T=anks.

Valeria

---------- Forwarded message ----------

F=om: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com=><=r>Date: Wed, Aug 22, 2018 at 3:57 PM
Subject: Re: Phone call

how did it go?

> wrote:

Thanks, leffrey.
Be=t,

Valeria

---------- Forwarded message ---------
F=om: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.c=m>
Date: Wed, Aug 22, 2018 at 2:50 PM
Subject: Re: Pho=e call
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im on the plane. with many people. will land in a few=hours. . the 500k note spoke to payments and
where=they were to bemade. but you were to pay it and then they were=obligated to pay to you so entire argument
is silly. €p=AD ask if he can think of a way for noam to rescind his resigantion letter=in favor of harry .

On Wed, Aug 22, 2018 at 2:43 PM, Valeria Chomsky _

We are going to talk to Vincent by phone in 30 minutes.
Anything we could bring to his attention? Would you like= be available to be part of it?

Thanks.

please note

The in=ormation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorn=y-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended=only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unau=horized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part th=reof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received t=is
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-=ail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all c=pies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved=br=
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