
From: brice gordon < 
Sent: Thursday, January 3, 2019 4:41 PM 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Richard Kahn; Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Re: 

Thank you Daphne 

After d=ing some more research 
Below are the estimated weights 
For our boats 
Little C estimated weight 
Nautica estimates weight 
16000 lbs 

Are we achieving anything by purchasin= a smaller water trailer ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 3, 2019, at 12:02 PM,=Daphne Wallace < 

=div dir="ltr"> 
Greetings Rich, 

Request: Obtain a quote f=r a 1000 gallon water wagon 

<mailto > wrote: 

Information: The attached quote for t=e 1000 water wagon has the exact specs as the 1600 gallon water wagon 
purch=sed in 2018. The 2018 purchase invoice is also attached for reference. = 

Qu=te: ABI Attachments 
Cost: (1) WW1=00 1000 gallon - ABI Water Trailer, with assy = $9,350.00 
Ta=es: $0.00 
Estimated=/span> Shipping to FL=/b>: $1,227.50 
Lead time: 3 weeks (estimated complet= by 1/25/19) 
EDA to FL: 7 business days (2/5/19) 
Estimated Shipping to STT: $3,500.00 <=div> 
Clearance: $80.00 
Trucking: $ 40=.00 
Total: $14,557.50 
<=iv> 

On Wed= Jan 2, 2019 at 3:09 PM Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gm=ilcom> 
> wrote: 
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<=lockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0px 0px 0px 0.8ex;border-le=t:lpx solid 
rgb(204,204,204);padding-left:lex"> 

daphne can you please o=tain quote for 1000 water wagon 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Fl=or 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
ce=al 

On Jan 2, 2019, at 3:08 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.c=m <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

= was told first that we needed a larger tractor to pull boats. then i= told that its for the water truck , 
just get a smaller watter t=uck of 1000 gallons instead of 1600 gallons. this is real=y silly 

please note 
=div>The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may=be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is=intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE=br>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any p=rt thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retur= e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all=copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserve= 

<ABI - Esti=ate_1219356 - LSJE, LLC - 1000 Gallon Water Trailer.pdf> 

<ABI - LSJE, LLC - INV20287=- BOL 13064671.pdf> 
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