From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 1:19 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: thursday bedford charter options

another option presented was lear 60 (see photos below)

prices are as =ollows:

Hawker 800A...511,049 all in....Hawker 800XP =12,151 all in....Lear £0...511,103 all =n....

please advise on departure and return =imes along with plane preference thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor
New =ork, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cel

Begin forwarded =essage:

Subject: Apollo

Date: September 25, 2017 at 1:55:03 PM EDT

here you =o... | have a Hawker 8004 (Mid Jet) 59,900 plus tax and fees...= also have a Hawker 800XP (Mid Jet) 510,925

plus tax..,
Please let =e know if this works

Glenn Levit

Apollo Jets

220'W. 42nd Street, 10th Floor
New York, NY 10036

Tel =12-810-4588

Mobile

Fax 917-398-3906
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=/div>

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: RE:

Date: September 25, 2017 at 2:23:22 PM EDT
ros Richard kaho ||

Hello...=| also have a Lear 60...2001 YOM...refurb 2016....59,95= plus tax and fees..,
Thxs

Glenn Levit

Apollo lets

220 W. 42nd Street, 10th Floor
New York, NY 10036

Tel =12-810-4588

Fax 917-398-3906

www.apollojets.com <http://www.apollojets.com/>

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b=RE:

Date: =/b>September 25, 2017 at 2:51:48 =M EDT

This is interior of the Lear &0..

EFTA_R1_01800872
EFTA02608355



Glenn Levit

Apollo Jets

220 W. 42nd Street, 10th Floor
MNew York, NY 10036

Tel =12-810-4588

Fax 917-398-8906

www.apollojets.com <http://www.apollojets.com/>

From: Richard Kahn |

m!er 25,2017 1:26 PM

Sent: Monday, Septe
To: Glenn Levi
Cc: Larry Visoski
Subject:

happy new year and hope you are well
locking for 2-3 passengers round =rip on 9/28/2017 - teterboro to bedford

looking for cheapest cost as we =lready have bid from jetsuite of 13k on CJ3

thanks

Richard Kahn

EFTA_R1_01800873
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HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, =th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

EFTA_R1_01800874
EFTA02608357



