From: Richard Kahn <

Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 3:13 PM
To:
Subject: Fwd: Origins Project at ASU

i just left you a voicemail at you office can you please call me when free thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

cell

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>] <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: =/b>Fwd: Origins =roject at ASU

Date: January 9, 2019 at 6:03:58 PM EST

-------—- Forwarded message ---------
From: =strong class="gmail_sendername" dir="auto">Gretchen Buhlig =span dir="ltr

class="

Date: =ed, Jan 9, 2019 at 5:03 PM

Subject: RE: Origins Project =t ASU

To: ) <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >
CC: Virginia =eSanto

, Gretchen Buhlig
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Hello Mr. Epstein,

Regarding the funding from Enhanced Education to =upport the Origins Project, the same would be true that we
will need =uthorization from Enhanced Education to transfer eligible funds.

Sincerely,

Gretchen

Gretchen Buhlig
CEOQ, ASU Foundation

TOGETHER, OUR POTENTIAL IS LIMITLESS
PO Box 2260 | Tempe, Arizona | =5280-2260

From: ) <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=> >
Sent: Tuesday, January 8, 2019 4:43 PM

To: Gretchen Buhlig

Subject: Re: Origins Project at ASU

and re enhanced education ?

On Tue, Jan 8, 2019 at 6:41 PM =retchen Buhi NN

wrote;

Mr. Epstein,

I'm writing to follow =p on our conversation regarding the transfer of funds donated by the =eon Black
Family Foundation to support the Origins Project at ASU.

In reviewing =ur records, it appears that the donations were made by Mr. and Mrs. =lack personally,
rather than through their Foundation. In order =0 ensure our records are complete, | will need a confirmation from
them that they are authorizing the =ransfer or that you have the authority to authorize the transfer on =heir behalf. A
simple letter stating that they authorize the =ransfer of funds from the ASU Foundation to the MIT Media Lab would be
sufficient.
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Upon further review, we need to reconfirm the amount =hat we would send based on other gifts for the
same purpose and =emaining unspent funds. | will need to obtain this information from our finance team and will let
you know that amount once we receive =ocumentation of the power to redirect. Thank you for your =atience.

Sincerely,

Gretchen

Gretchen Buhlig
CEOD, ASU Foundation

TOGETHER, OUR POTENTIAL IS LIMITLESS

PO Box 2260 | Temiel Arizona | =5280-2260

please =ote

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
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Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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