
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 2, 2019 11:38 PM 
To: LSJ GSJ 
Subject: Re: Nautitect 

do it 

On Wed, Jan 2, 2019 at 6:37 PM LS1 GSJ > 
wrote: 

Good Evening 
Please note estimate for repair work on Nautica 
$13,500.00 
Please advise how you wish to proceed=C2 

list regards 

Begin forwarded message: 

=div dir="ltr">From: Randy Amparo <randydelrio@hotmail.com <mailto:randydelri=@hotmail.com» 
Date= Janua 2 2019 at 7:06:37 PM AST 

• ' 

Su • tect:<=.> Fw : Nautitect 

Sent =rom my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eldred Williams 
Date: January 2, 201 
To: Carlos Rodriguez 

br> Subject: Nautitect 

Happy New Year! 

andy Amparo 
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Hope you had a Wonderfull Holiday. 

Concerning the Rotten areas on the Nautitect. 
To remove and manufacture new floor, and to remove all rotten wood and=replace with new on 

both Starboard and Port entrance we are estimating abo=t $13,500.00. 

Please note this is only an estimate. 

Thank you and Regards 

Narinee Seonarain 
Nanny Cay Marina 
P.O. Box 824 Road Town 
Tortola, British Virgin Islands 

URL: www.bvipainters.com <http://www.bvipainters.com> 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged =may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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