
From: Kyle reavis < 
Sent: Wednesday, December 5, 2018 12:01 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Cc: Richard Kahn; brice gordon 
Subject: Fwd: Notice To Proceed - EIFS 

Mr Epstein, 

Jay will have a crew =ut on Thursday to start this scope, please see below. 

Kyle 

<=iv class="gmail_quote"> 
 Forwarded message ---=-----
From: Jay Knoepfe= < < 
Date: Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 7:48 AM 
Subject: Re: No=ice To Proceed - EIFS 
To: Kyle reavis < 

> > 

> > 

We will get a crew organized by Thursday. The Library and master bedr=om are included in the price of the roofing 
$250,000. We will only =e working on the kitchen and cabanas at this time. The kitchen and =abana EFFIS repair is 
scheduled to complete on the 14th 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 4, 2018, at 2:26 PM, Kyle reavis < 

Jay, 

» wrote: 

In addition I wanted to confirm that EIFS pricing for the Library an M=ster are a deduct from the original roof 
contract price since they were in=luded in the original bids. Thank you! 

Kyle 

 Forwarded message 
From: Kyle reavis =span dir="ltr"> < 
Date: Tue, Dec 4, 2018 at 2:08 PM 
Subject: Notice To Proceed - EIFS 
To: Jay Knoepfel < 
Cc: brice ordon < 

<mailto 

<mailto 

>>> 

», Richard Kahn 

EFTA_R1_01805517 
EFTA02610659



Jay, 

The pricing was approved for the EIFS work on the main compound. =Please let me know a soon as you can get 
men out here to get this started.=C24> Thank you! 

Very Respectfully, 

Kyle Reavis 
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