From: valeria Chomsky <[ RN -

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 2:40 AM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: Massachusetts Estimate

<=div>

---------- Forwarded message --------=-

From: Deborah Pechet Quinan c_ <mailta_:- =
D=te: Tue, Dec 19, 201/ at 5:51 PM

Subject: Massachusetts Estimate

To:="Noam Chomsky (

> >, "Waleria Chomsky |

Dear Noam and Valeria,

| have not yet heard from Richard regarding his reco=mendation for a Massachusetts estimated tax payment. As you
know | r=quested a specific response to Matthew Mazotas’ recommendation tha= we make a Massachusetts estimate in
the amount of $30,000.

I am inclined to follow the advice of Matthew and Ni=k, your CPAs, in the absence of a response from Richard. If you
agre= please let me know and | will reach out to Max tomorrow so that he can ma=e this payment on your behalf. |
believe he will be amenable to this request in addition to the $150,000 for the fe=eral estimate.

Best,

Deborah

Deborah Pechet Qui=an, Esq. LL.M.4=A0

Shareholder

Chair, Trusts & E=tates Group

255 State Street,=7th Floor

<https://maps.google.com/?q=255+5tate+5treet,+ Tth+Floor%C2%A0%7="6C2%A0Boston,+MA+02 109&entry=gmail &sou
ree=gs> <=

href="https://maps.google.com/?q=255+5tate+5treet, + Tth+FloorfC2%A0%7 C=C2%A0Boston, +MA+02 109&entry=gmail
&source=g">| Boston, MA 02109
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<https://maps.google=com/?q=255+5tate+5treet,+7th+Floor%C2%A0%7C%C 2%A0Boston, +MA+02109&en=ry=gmail&so
urce=g=

oirect: I

Assistant - Jayne Mahoney: >
Office: <tel
=span style="color:#fcbb31">| riw.com <http://=ww.riw.com/> | BIO

e-mail:
<http://www.riw.com/at=orney/deborah-pechet-quinan/=
<=2

MNOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for per=itted use by authorized recipients. If you are
not an authorized recipient=of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this em=il is prohibited. If
you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and it= attachments from your devices
and systems.
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