
From: Kyle reavis 
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 8:15 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Ken & Countertops 

Ken was trying to do a partial install of 1-4 counter tops= not a single vanity. Then leave to make more cuts and come 
back out=Monday. I told him that is BS and Cabana 1 needs to be done along wi=h the others and 100% done. So he 
said he will finish cuts tomorrow =or the vanity tops and come out Sunday at 8 am. 

On Fri, Dec 14, 2018 at 4:10 PM J &l=;jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wr=te: 

wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kyle reavis < > 

Re: Ken & Countertops<=r> 
Date: December 14, 2018 at 2:59:20 =M EST 

To: Richard Kahn 

Cc: brice gordon 

Rich, 

Phone died, I need to get a new one tomorrow. Ken has pieces cut a=d is supposed to come out Sunday 
at 8am to start the install. I will=be out here with him to document. 

EFTA_R1_01806861 
EFTA02611360



Kyle 

On Fri, Dec 14, 2018 at 3:=6 PM Richard Kahn 
<mailto >  wrote: 

kyle i just tried calling you and i heard =esponse that your VM has not been set up yet.. 

brice / kyle can you please provide update on your meeting with Ken today thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

please notear> 
The information contained in this communication is confidentiaL=may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, a=d is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property ofar>.IEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication =r any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you h=ve 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately b= return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communica=ion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all r=ghts reserved 
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