
From: Richard Kahn < > 
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 4:21 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: Batteries 

please advise on response 
thank =ou 

305kWh Lithium =ron Batteries 

$400,588.00 

Buyback of Aquion Batteries 

-90,000.00 

Adjusted cost 

$310,588.00 

His supposed 330,000 plus at most 15,000 for shipping = =45,000 - 90,000 = 255,000 adjusted cost to GSJ... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cet 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Brian Prosolar < 

Subject: =/b>Fwd: =atteries 

Date: =/b>December 14, 2018 at 11:15:18 =M EST 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 
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Please see below. 

Brian Walden 
ProSolar America, =lc 
Director of = erations 

Begin =orwarded message: 

From: Bkwalden <mailto 
Date: December 12, 2018 at 11:35:10 AM AST 
To: Erika Kellerhals 
Subject: Re: Batteries 

> > 

The quote for the =torage components and shipping to Florida is $330,000. 
There is a 15% margin for the product plus shipping and =nstallation. 

Brian =alden 
3 <tel:340.643.8709> 40.626.7582. =ell 

On Dec =2, 2018, at 7:56 AM, Erika Kellerhals > wrote: 

Mr. Epstein would like to know =he cost of the batteries to ProSolar and what the proposed 
markup is in =he estimate you provided. 

Erika A. =ellerhals 
Member 
Kellerhals Ferguson =roblin PLLC 
Royal Palms Professional =uilding 
9053 Estate Thomas Suite 101 
St. =homas, VI 00802 
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' • - href="mailto 
=lass="" 

Tel: 
Cell 
Fax 

target="_blank" 

Notice: This communication may =ontain privileged or other confidential information. If you 
are =ot the intended recipient, or believe that you have received this =ommunication in error, please do not print, copy, 
re-transmit, =isseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also, please =ndicate to the sender that you have received 
this e-mail in error, and =elete the copy you received. Thank you. 

Prosolar =ystems 

Caribbean: 
Florida: 

Let's Get =ocial 
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