
From: Nicholas Ribis 
Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 5:56 PM 
To: jeffrey E.' 
Subject: RE: Re: 

Yes working on it 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 12:55 PM 
To: Nicholas Ribis Richard Kahn 41 :> 
Subject: Re: 

and i assume the balance before the end of year as promised ? yes ? 

On Wed, Dec 20, 2017 at 10:53 AM, Nicholas Ribis 
<mailto > wrote: 

50 k wire today 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
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