From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Importance:

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

tel

fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

Richard Kahn

Wednesday, December 20, 2017 9:50 PM

jeffrey E.

Fwd: Estimated Tax Payment Voucher Needed
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From: =/b=Deborah Pechet Quinan _

Subject: =/b>FW: Estimated Tax =ayment Voucher Meeded

Date: =/b=December 20, 2017 at 4:44:44 PM =5T

To: =/b>Max kohlenberz <

Dear Max,

| attach = Massachusetts fourth quarter estimated tax voucher in the amount of =30,000 forwarded from
Matthew Mazotas at Nick Nichols' =ffice. As we discussed on Monday, please make the payment =irectly to the MDOR,
when you make the federal estimate. As you =now the Massachusetts estimate also needs to be paid before =2/31. If
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you could please confirm when both estimated tax =ayments have been made and provide copies to Matthew, that
would be =ery helpful.

Thanks,
Deborah

Deborah Pechet Quinan, Esqg. LL.M.
Shareholder

Chair, Trusts & Estates =roup

255 State Street, 7th Floor | Boston, MA 02109
pirect: || G ce
Assistant - =ayne Mahoney:
Office
e-mail:

www.riw.com <http://www.riw.com/> | BIO
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