From: Richard Kahn {

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 3:26 PM
To: Brian Prosolar
Subject: Re: settlement

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Dec 12, 2018, at 10:41 AM, Richard Kahn — wrote:

can you please advise =n the actual vendor cost of the batteries you are suggesting below
thank you
305kWh Lithium =ron Batteries

5400,588.00

Richard Kahn

HBREK =ssociates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th =loor
New York, NY 10022
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Begin forwarded message:

From: rik kel

Subject: Fwd: settlement

Date: December 7, 2018 at 7:14:42 PM EST

<jeevacation@gmail.com=

Good evening. See attached which ProSolar sent =or settlement purposes.

Erika A. =ellerhals

Member

Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC
Royal Palm Professional Building
9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101
5t. Thomas, VI 00802

Motice: This communication may contain privileged or =ther confidential information. If you are not the
intended =ecipient, or believe that you have received this communication in =rror, please do not print, copy, re-
transmit, disseminate, or otherwise =se this information. Also, please indicate to the sender that you =ave received this
e-mail in error, and delete the copy you =eceived. Thank you.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Brian Prosolar _

Date: December 7, 2018 at 6:22:34 PM AST
To:
Subject: =b class=

=settlement

For =our review.

Brian Walden
Director of Operations, =5VI/ BVI
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Prosolar America, =lc.

Prosolar =ystems

Let's Get =ocial

z=div>
<G5 =ettlement.docx>
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