
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Sunday, December 9, 2018 2:49 AM 
To: Jeffrey 
Subject: Re: 

I tried to purchase it anyway. But the order does not go through, some =eb error. I tried two credit cards. 
Will probably have to call them. 

> On Dec 8, 2018, at 9:42 PM, Karyna Shuliak 

> it says there is only 1 ticket available left for the workshop :( The 
> next reading is on Feb 9th 

» On Dec 8, 2018, at 12:19 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

» =ttps://www.metguild.org/guild/Lectures/PerformanceDetails.aspx?Perf I 
» d=8=39 
» sign us up 
» --
» please note 
» The information contained in this communication is confidential, may 
» be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside information, and 
» is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
» JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or 
» any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
» have received this communication in error, please notify us 
» immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, 
» and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all 
» attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

rote: 

■ 
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