
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 4:24 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Glion Balance Statement 

Dear Mr Epstein, 

l=have sent Mr Kahn the refund form. 

He did no= reply. 

I will let the accounting department=know, that the money is theirs. 

Best regards, 

On 27 Nov 2018, at 21:15, J <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com> wrote: 

<= class="MsoNormal">From 
>1 

Sent: lundi 26 novembre 2018 12:05 
To: Students Accounting <studentsaccounting@glion.edu <mailto:studentsaccounting@glio=.edu» 
Subject: Re: GIHE - Balance in your favor 

Good afternoon, 

This information is no longer valid and my only f=nancial sponsor is my mother. 

Best regards, 

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 12:07 P 

Dear Mr Epstein, 

&=t; wrote: 
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Hope you're doing well. 
I have received a statement from Glion, in which it says that the balance on=the student account is in 

my favor. I have contacted Richard Kahn, in case h= wants to reimburse the money, but he did not reply. 
Therefore I am writing to you just to clarify this information in case you w=sh to let him know yourself. 

Best regards, 

please note 

Th= information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intend=d only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Una=thorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part th=reof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received th=s 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-ma=l or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copie= thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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