From: s) s <

Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 10:51 AM

To: Richard Kahn

Cc: Daphne Wallace; _; JE Epstein
Subject: Re: LSJE_CC_OFFSHO_581.72_112518

Goo= Morning Rich

Carlos has kindly made Calypso availabl= to use, given we had Little C down with engine issues and as you know
both=Nautica and Sportis are out of the rotation It h=s been very helpful with crew runs alone While being u=ed the key
broke in ignition, hence repair required H=ping this answers your concerns Thanks

On Nov 26, 2018, at 7:26 PM, Richard Kahn <[ < I - > v ote:

<=lockquote type="cite">

karen why are we paying for parts on c=rlos boat?

also if we are buying new engine for 23k from off=hore shouldn’t assessment charge be waived...
=lease advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexin=ton Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

wrote:

On N-v 26, 2018, at 532 AM, Daphne Wallace < NN <M -

Greeting= Rich,
For payment via A=EX:

Offshore Mari=e: $581.72 (NOV charges)

---------- Forwarded message ---------

rrom: s 5. < < I -

Subject: LSJE_CC_OFFSHO =81.72 112518

To: Daphne Walace < A < -

EFTA_R1_01810734
EFTA02613357



==r class="">
Good Evening Daphne=nbsp;
Attached completed Credit Card Request for Offshore Ma=ine

Warmest regards
Karen

The 5t. J=mes Group
6100 Red Hook Quarter
Sui=e B3

St Thomas

Usy| 00802
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