
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

brice gordon sommu > 
Sunday, November 11, 2018 6:17 PM 
J 
Re: LS1 RO Fiber 

On Nov 1=, 2018, at 9:21 AM,1 <jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

ok 

On Sun, Nov 11, 2018 at 11:11 AM brice gordon •; => wrote: 

=div class="gmail_default" style="font•size:small">Hello Rich 
=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small"> 

Cost:$2753.69 
Rogers Electric for Conduit. </=iv> 
Cost:$7520.43 plu= shipping 

adiv> 
Estimated Cost: $=0,274.12 
<=r> 
We are unable to Pull New Fiber in the the Existing Conduit &n=sp;from the 

Intake Pump Controls. The fiber=connection allows the RO Plant to communicate to 
Pumps=located outside the Tunnel. 

The conduit is for the Duct Bank, to b= dug from the Generator Building out 
&nbs=;with a new feeder for GSJ. 

At this time the Sea Water Intake pum=s are being run in Manual Mode. 
LSJ will Dig, Install conduit and=Pull Fiber. 

Can we proceed with ordering Fiber and=Conduit? 

regards 

Brice Gordon 
The Saint lames Group 
USVI 

Ph: 
</=iv> 

Generator Building to Sea Water 
the Sea Water Intake 

to the Sea Water Intake building, 

EFTA_R1_01813001 
EFTA02614532



&nb=p; please note 

The information contai=ed in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privile=ed, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, discl=sure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly pr=hibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication i= error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.c=m <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
includi=g all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01813002 
EFTA02614533


